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A 16-year-old boy presented to the emergency 
department with a 10-day history of abdominal 

pain and vomiting. Since childhood he had ex-
perienced occasional stomach pain and vomiting 
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related to his food intake. He denied diarrhea and 
other symptoms. An abdominal ultrasound was 
performed, revealing intussusception in the right 
hemiabdomen. It also showed a thickened and 
hypervascularized central intestinal gyrus within 
the cecum and ascending colon. Abdominal CT 
was also performed, revealing an invagination 
in the area of   the ileocecum, with its head in the 
middle of the transverse colon. The presence of a 
mass was suspected at the head of the invagina-
tion, measuring approximately 5 × 3 cm (Panel 
A and B). Emergency exploratory surgery con-
firmed the radiologically verified intussusception 
(Panel C). Intraoperatively, a ~5 cm soft mass was 
found, occupying ~2/3 of the intestinal lumen. The 
mass was located approximately 50 cm proximal 
from the Bauchini valve. Partial ileal resection was 

performed with end-to-end hand-sewn ileal anas-
tomosis. Gross examination of the resected speci-
men revealed a polypoid lesion that measured 50 
× 30 × 25 mm (Panel D). Histopathological exami-
nation confirmed a well-demarcated polyp, lined 
by a foveolar type epithelium, with all the elements 
found in the gastric mucosa, and well-developed 
gastric glands (Panel E and F). No dysplasia or ma-
lignancy was identified within the gastric heteroto-
pia. On the basis of the radiological, intraoperative 
and histopathological features, a giant polypoid 
gastric heterotopia was diagnosed. A second opin-
ion was sought from an expert gastrointestinal pa-
thologist who concurred with the final diagnosis.
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